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Welcome to Temple Baptist Church of Rogers! 

“Christ, Our Hope in Life and Death” 

WELCOME  

“Standing on The Promises” 

“Our God Will Go Before Us” 

“Never Once” 

MESSAGE John O’Connor 

“Trust and Obey” 

CLOSING PRAYER 

June 30, 2024 



S E R M O N  N O T E S :  



DEACON OF THE MONTH  

Ron Simpson ONLINE GIVING 
http://easytithe.com/

tbcrogers 

UPCOMING EVENTS 

Today 5th Sunday Fellowship 
Meal—Noon 

July 2-6 SOAR Youth Conference 
Dallas, TX 

July 7 Ron Simpson returns from 
Mission Trip to Sri Lanka  

July 14-18 Vacation Bible School 

9:00 AM Joyce White 
10:30 AM Elaine Simpson 

NURSERY VOLUNTEERS 

JUNE 23 REPORT   

Worship Service 92 

Sunday School 64 

  

General Fund $6,228.55 

Youth $25.00 

 The past year has brought about 
many opportunities to celebrate in our 
family—our son, Caleb, married the love 
of his life last November; Joanna and I 
celebrated thirty years of marriage in 
December; and our daughter, Carly, was 
recently blessed with a job serving the 
Lord in her specific area of giftedness. 
God has truly blessed us this past year! 

However, the year has not been with-
out its challenges. In November, Joanna 
broke her arm near the shoulder socket. 
By God’s grace, she has been able to 
rehab her injury, but she is still not back 
to one-hundred-percent. 

As Joanna was finishing up her time 
of rehab in March, I suffered a minor 
stroke in the occipital lobe of my brain. 
Six weeks later, I found myself in the 
emergency room with chest pains. Two 
days later, surgeons put in a stent to 
alleviate a ninety-five-percent blockage 
in my widow-maker artery. The fact that 
we are able to continue to serve here in 
this place—in spite of these difficulties—
is truly a blessing from God! 

It was 3,654 days ago when I stood 

before you for the first time as your lead 
pastor. I am honored to serve the Lord in 
this role, and I am humbled when I think 
of how often I fail to shepherd you in the 
ways you need. I am so thankful that 
God has given me a team of men who 
partner with me as we attempt to serve 
the Lord by serving one another.  

Thank you pastors (Ron, John and 
David) for coming alongside of me and 
filling in the gaps where my ministry 
prowess falters. You are an integral part 
of the ministry here at Temple! 

As I look forward to the next decade 
and beyond, I see great things in store 
for our church! I want to thank you for 
allowing me to go on this journey with 
you. My prayer is that—above all else 
—God will be glorified in everything 
that is said and done in this place, that 
people will come to know the Lord as 
their Savior as a result of our ministry 
and outreach, and people will grow up 
in their faith to become mature men and 
women of God.  

Thank you for allowing me to serve 
you as your pastor these past ten years! 

CELEBRATING TEN YEARS OF SERVICE BY WADE ALLEN 
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